

## Freedom of Information Act Disclosure log - Reply Extract

|                 |                          |
|-----------------|--------------------------|
| File reference  | W22FOI161                |
| Key words       | Mental Health Facilities |
| Date of release | 01/07/2022               |
| Attachments     | No                       |

### You asked

**A. For 2021 please supply the total number of times a patient absconded from inpatient mental health facilities within the Trust.**

The Trust does not provide inpatient mental health facilities and consequentially does not hold the information requested.

Livewell Southwest is the Community Interest Company commissioned to provide this service. Their contact details are available on their website here: <https://www.livewellsouthwest.co.uk/>

Please note they are not subject to the requirements of the Freedom of Information Act and your enquiry will need to be an informal one.

NHS Devon Clinical Commissioning Group (NHS Devon CCG) are subject to the Freedom of Information Act and may be able to help you with some of the information you require. To request information from them please use this link: <https://devonccg.nhs.uk/>

**i. A breakdown of absconsions per facility**

Not applicable

**B. For 2020 please supply the total number of times a patient absconded from inpatient mental health facilities within the Trust.**

As above

**i. A breakdown of absconsions per facility**

Not applicable

**C. For 2019 please supply the total number of times a patient absconded from inpatient mental health facilities within the Trust.**

As above

**i. A breakdown of absconsions per facility**



Not applicable

**Legal notes**

University Hospitals Plymouth NHS Trust is confirming in accordance with section 1 (a) of the Act that it does not hold the information requested.

**Attachments included:** No