

File reference	W16FOI656
Key words	Fleet cars – Electric and hybrid
Date of release	20/01/2017
Attachments	No

Freedom of Information Act Disclosure log - Reply Extract

We would like the following information:

Please supply this information for the last three years namely 2013/14, 2014/15 and 2015/16 to date.

1. Do you have any electric or hybrid cars in your fleet?

No

2. How many cars are there in the fleet and how many are electric or hybrid?

24

3. How many miles or kilometres per year does a petrol/diesel car log on average, what is the comparative figure for an electric or hybrid car?

This information is not held.

4. How often have petrol/diesel cars had to be towed or recovered from breakdown, what is the comparative figure for electric or hybrid cars?

This information is not held.

5. Including all costs, charges and any amortisation, can you compare the cost of petrol/diesel cars per mile or kilometre travelled with a similar electric or hybrid car, if so please supply those figures?

There are no electric or hybrid cars in our fleet to compare

6. How often, over each twelve month period, is a diesel/petrol car booked out for use and what is the comparative figure for an electric or hybrid car?

This information is not held.

Attachments included: No